
Residentia
l Trash Recycle

Yard 
Service

Additional 
Carts

2 yard 
dumpster

4 yard 
dumpster

6 yard 
dumpster

8 yard 
dumpster

Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4 Year 1 Year 2 Year 3 Year 4
Aspen 13.46 14 15.12 16.33 8.5 8.84 9.55 10.31 13.46 14 15.12 16.33 5 5.2 5.62 6.07 66 68.64 74.13 80.06 86 89.44 96.6 104.3 104 108.2 116.8 126.2 120 124.8 134.8 145.6
Republic 19.99 20.99 22.04 23.14 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid 8 8.5 9 9.5 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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